
Bid Tabulation RFB 35-09SEP20 

Bid Opening: RFB07-1SMAR21- Pre-Printed Envelopes for the Assessor 

Bid Tabu lation QTY Bear Graphics, Inc. University of Missouri Print & Mail Services Weldon, Williams, & Lick 

Blink Swag 

Une Item 4.10.1 

#10 White wove Window Envelopes 
50,000 $26.50/M $28.00/M $40.00/M $50.00/M 

per section 2.2.1. with delivery on or 

before June 01, 2021. 

Line Item 4.10.2 

Delivery of above item 4.10.1: FOB 

Shipping with inside delivery to the 

3rd floor of the Government Center, 
1 No Response $SO.DO Included $696.00 

801 E. Walnut Street, Columbia, MO 

65201 

Line Item 4.10.3 

#10 White wove Window Envelopes 

per section 2.2.1. with delivery in 150,000 $22.80/M $28.00/M $30.00/M $40/M 
December 2021. 

Line Item 4.10.4 

Delivery of above item 4.10.3: FOB 

Shipp ing with inside delivery to the 

3rd floor of the Government Center, 1 No Response $100.00 Included $888.10 

801 E. Wa lnut Street, Columbia, MO 

65201 

Line Item 4.10.5 

Custom 4"x 8 7 /8" Pastel Green Wove 

Business Reply Insert Envelopes per 

section 2.2.3. with delivery in $24.19/M $38.20/M $30.00/M $40.00/M 

December 2021 

150,000 

Line Item 4.10.6 

Delivery of item 4.10.5: FOB Shipping 

with inside delivery to the 3rd floor of 

the Government Center, 801 E. No Response $100.00 Included $859.72 

Walnut Street, Columbia, MO 65201 

1 

Envelopes Grand Total: Quote the 

Grand Total Price for line items 

4.10.1, 4.10.3, and 4.10.5 based on 

the extended prices (total quantity $8,373.50 $11,330.00 $11,000.00 $14,500.00 

extended price): 

Delivery Grand Total: Quote the 

Grand Total Price for line items 

4.10.2, 4.10.4, and 4.10.6 based on 

the extended prices (tota l quantity Included $250.00 Included $2,443.82 

extended price) : 

Delivery 

June 1st/December June 1st/December 1st June 1st/December June 1st/December 1st 

Co-Op 

Unknown No Yes Yes 
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Bid Tabu lation RFB 35 -09SEP20 

Bid Opening: RFB07-1SMAR21- Pre-Printed Envelopes 

Bid Tabulation QTY General Printing Service St. Louis Print Group Cenveo Staples UniPak MCAUiey Printing Commercial Concepts 

Furnishings 

line Item 4.10.1 

#10 White wove Window Enve lopes 
50,000 $33.73/M $24.75.M $40.40/M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

per section 2.2.1. with delivery on or 

before June 01, 2021. 

line Item 4.10.2 

Delivery of above item 4.10.L FOB 

Shipping with inside delivery to the 

3rd floor of the Government Center, 
1 N/A $275.00 Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

801 E. Walnut Street , Columbia, MO 

65201 

line Item 4.10.3 

#10 White wove Window Enve lopes 

per section 2.2.1. with delivery in 150,000 $35.15/M $24.75.M $28.00/M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

December 2021. 

line Item 4.10.4 

Delivery of above item 4.10.3: FOB 

Shipping with inside delivery to the 

3rd floor of the Government Center, 1 N/A $400.00 Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

801 E. Walnut Street, Columbia, MO 

65201 

line Item 4.10.5 

Custom 4"x 8 7/8" Pastel Green Wove 

Business Reply Insert Envelopes per $34.90/M 
section 2.2.3. with delivery in $36.35/M 

Alt : double-seam $19.93/M 
$36.50/M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

December 2021 

150,000 

line Item 4.10.6 

Delivery of item 4.10.5: FOB Sh ipping 

with inside delivery to the 3rd floor of 

the Government Center, 801 E. N/A $400.00 Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Walnut Street, Columbia, MO 65201 

1 

Envelopes Grand Total: Quote the 

Grand Total Price for line items 

4.10.1, 4.10.3, and 4.10.5 based on 

the extended prices (total quantity $12,484.39 $10,185.00 $11,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

extended price): 

Delivery Grand Total: Quote the 

Grand Total Price for line items 

4.10.2, 4.10.4, and 4.10.6 based on 

the extended prices (total quantity N/A $1,075.00 Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

extended price): 

Del ivery 

June 1st/December 1st June 1st/December 3rd June 1st/December 6th No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Co-Op 

Yes Yes Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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